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C Listed - Local Significance

STATEMENT OF SIGNIFICANCE

The house at 8 Prospect Avenue is aesthetically significant at a LOCAL level. It demonstrates original design
qualities of the interwar Bungalow style. These qualities include the dominant hipped roof form, together with a
minor hipped roof and flat roofed verandah that project towards the street frontage. Other intact qualities include
the weatherboard wall cladding, wide eaves, timber framed double hung windows arranged in horizontal banks of
three, double front timber and glazed? doors, flat roofed verandah which extends across to form a narrow window
hood, square and rendered brick verandah pillars with concrete cappings, rendered brick piers, solid rendered
balustrade with a concrete capping, window leadlighting, exposed brick soldier course bands on the verandah
piers and the exposed brick patterning on the verandah balustrade.

The house at 8 Prospect Avenue is historically significant at a LOCAL level. It is associated with the Glendural
Estate subdivision of 29 January, 1921, and with Eric Lyons, designer and builder.

Overall, the house at 8 Prospect Avenue is of LOCAL significance.
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DESCRIPTION

The site at 8 Prospect Avenue has a typical front setback of approximately 5 metres, with smaller side setbacks
and a driveway along the side. These setbacks are shown on the 1939 GWST Plan of Drainage.4 A recent timber



picket fence forms the front boundary and is approximately 1500mm high.

The asymmetrical, single storey, weatherboard interwar Bungalow house is characterised by a dominant hipped
roof form, together with a minor hipped roof and flat roofed verandah that project towards the street frontage.
These roof forms appear to be clad in corrugated zincalume. A recent, second storey hipped roof extension is
situated at the rear. Wide overhangs are a feature of the eaves. The early timber framed double hung windows
are arranged in horizontal banks of three on the street facade. The double front timber and glazed? doors also
appear to be early.

A feature of the design is the flat roofed verandah, which extends across to form a narrow window hood. The
verandah is supported by early, square and rendered brick pillars with concrete cappings, which in turn are
supported by early rendered brick piers. A solid rendered balustrade with a concrete capping forms the verandah
boundary.

Early decorative features of the design include the window leadlighting, exposed brick soldier course bands on
the verandah piers and the exposed brick patterning on the verandah balustrade.

This place/object may be included in the Victorian Heritage Register pursuant to the Heritage Act 2017. Check
the Victorian Heritage Database, selecting 'Heritage Victoria' as the place source.

For further details about Heritage Overlay places, contact the relevant local council or go to Planning Schemes
Online http://planningschemes.dpcd.vic.gov.au/
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